
 
 

 

 

 
   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

st of 2 Parts 
 
For many years now, the whole world 
has been struggling with how to deal 
with the twin evils of Inequality and 

Exclusion. These two evils have led to worldwide 
poverty and hunger, and many other 
dehumanizing ills of society in countries, big or 
small, developed or under-developed, 
autocracies or democracies.  

 

In his apostolic exhortation, “The Joy of the 
Gospel”, Pope Francis had this to say about these  

number of complaints for debt collection 
harassment. From 485 complaints in May 2019, the 
National Privacy Commission (NPC) handled 1,867 
complaints in December 2020, an increase of over 
200%. 

 
What to expect if you miss a business loan 
payment 
 
First, know that no one gets imprisoned for non-

payment of a loan, as per the 1987 Philippine 

Constitution. 
                                          (continued on page 2) 

  

 

his policy memo was submitted to 
the Harvard Kennedy School as 
final requirement to API 121 
Recession, Growth and 
Macroeconomic Policy under 

Professor Karen Dynan. A copy of this was 
forwarded to the Department of Finance, the 
Senate and the House of Representatives for 
their consideration in addressing high inflation in 
the Philippines which is at 8% for November 
2022. 
  

member states).  

 
The primary school case was documented by an 
updated cross-country 2022 report of the World 
Bank on the subject where we ended miserably on 
the development indicator on reading (the learning 

poverty indicator indicative of the ability to read a 
simple text with comprehension by age 10), writing, 
mathematics, and global citizenship by Grade 5. 
 
                                         (continued on page 4) 

 

 
twin evils: “Today we also have to say “Thou Shall 
Not” to the economy of Inequality and Exclusion. 
Such an economy kills. 
 

How can it be that it is not a news item when an 
elderly person dies of exposure but is news when 
the stock market loses two points?.... Some 
people continue to defend trickle-down theories 
which assume that economic growth, encouraged 
by a free market, will inevitably succeed bringing 

about greater justice and inclusiveness in the 

world. This opinion, which has never been  
                                        (continued on page 2) 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
For   :   Hon. Benjamin Diokno, Finance Secretary  

            of the Philippines 
From:   Raymond Abrea, MC/MPA Program,  
            Harvard Kennedy School 
Re    :    Addressing High Inflation in the Philippines  
 

INTRODUCTION 
 
While contractionary monetary policy seems to be 
the preferred method of controlling inflation, 
 
                                        (continued on page 3) 
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confirmed by the facts, expresses a crude and 
naïve trust in the goodness of those wielding 
economic power and in the secularized workings 
of the prevailing economic system. Meanwhile, 
the excluded are still waiting….”  
 
This exhortation followed the Pope’s earlier 

encyclical “Laudato Si” where he lamented 
that…”Never have we so hurt and mistreated our 
common home as we have in the last 200 years…. 
The world must hear both the cry of the earth and 
of the poor.” 
 

How serious are these two global problems?  

 
On Inequality, we read that the 10 richest men in 
the world own more wealth than the 40% (3.1 
billion people) of humanity. The richest 1% have 
22% of global income. In the Philippines, the 
wealthiest 1% has 17% of national income while 

the bottom 50% earns only 14%. Our GINI 
Coefficient, which is a measure of inequality in a 
country, is at 42.3% - the worst in ASEAN and 
one of the worst in East Asia (based on the latest 
World Bank report). We also have the distinction 
of having the worst poverty ratio in ASEAN which, 
due to COVID, had even worsened from 16.7% to 

23.7%. All the other ASEAN countries have 
single-digit poverty ratios. 

 
On Exclusion, there are still glass (if not brick) 
ceilings for women in the professions, even in 
boardrooms. In some family-owned and 

controlled companies, there are limits to 
professional growth of non-family members. In 
hiring, some companies prefer graduates of elite 
schools as some discriminate against older people 
if not people with disabilities. Many financial 
institutions continue to require more stringent 
requirements for farmers and small 

entrepreneurs. And banks would rather pay 
penalties for not complying with loan level 
requirements for the agri-agra sector (which 
deprives this sector of up to P600 billion of 
financing annually). Other examples of Exclusion 

are: ostracizing the unwilling targets of sexual 
harassment, exclusion due to religion and 

economic status, and many more. 
 
What can be done to combat these Twin 
Evils? 
 
The World Bank prescribes Shared Prosperity 

along with ending extreme poverty. This means, 
among others, increasing the incomes and 
welfare of the bottom 40% of society, wherever 
they are. The 17 Sustainable Development Goals 
of the United Nations include not only reducing  
 

inequalities but other societal ills, like poverty, To 
hunger, education, gender equality, etc. The 
Institute of Corporate Directors in the last 20+ 

years of its advocacy had been helping the 

corporate world create more wealth with good 
governance and encouraging them to sharing 
that wealth with their stakeholders. 
 
What is the Response of Business to the 
Twin Evils? 
 

In August 2019, the Business Roundtable, a 
business association in the United States made 
up of the top 181 CEOs in America (Tim Cook of 
Apple, Jeff Bezos of Amazon, Jamie Dyson of JP 
Morgan, and other CEOs - Microsoft, Google, GE, 
General Motors, etc.) issued a statement that 

reflected a collective change of heart of Corporate 

America – from a stockholder-centric mindset 
(total stockholder returns) to a stakeholder-
centric one. The CEOs promised to: (1) deliver 
value to their customers, (2) invest in their 
employees, (3) deal fairly and ethically with their 
suppliers, (4) support the communities in which 

they work, and, (5) generate long-term value for 
shareholders who provide capital that allows 
companies to invest, grow and innovate. This 
document essentially declared that the purpose 
of a corporation is now for the interest of all 
stakeholders, and not just for the stockholders. 
 

In November 2020, the Management Association 
of the Philippines (MAP) and the Institute of 

Corporate Directors (ICD) together with 26 other 
large business and professional organizations, in 
a convocation called for the purpose, signed a 
Covenant for Shared Prosperity (CSP) that 

detailed the business groups’ commitments to six 
stakeholders; to wit: (1) quality products and 
services to customers, (2) meaningful and gainful 
employment for employees, (3) fair, ethical and 
respectful treatment of suppliers (product, 
service and funds providers), (4) active 
involvement in the community, (5) protection of 

the environment, and (6) reasonable and just 
returns to stockholders. These commitments are 
described in detail in the Covenant signed by the 
28 business groups. 
 

Subsequent to the signing of the CSP, MAP 
organized a committee tasked to promote the 

adoption of the Covenant and to develop a set of 
metrics to guide the future individual company-
signatories in the operationalization of Shared 
Prosperity in their respective companies. Using 
the World Economic Forum’s 45 metrics on 
Shared Prosperity as basis, the Committee 

decided to adopt 19 measures on SP plus another 
3 measures for the companies’ board of directors. 
This will soon be rolled out to the membership of 
MAP, first, and later to the membership of the 
other 27 organizations that signed the covenant.  
 

2 



 
 

The 19+3 metrics will soon be part of the MAP 
website once these are finalized. 
 

Why Shared Prosperity? (This question will be 

answered in Part II of this article.) 
 
(The author is Co-Chair for Social/Shared 
Prosperity of the MAP Committee on ESG. He is 
also Vice Chair of Center for Excellence in 
Governance (CEG). Feedback at 
<map@map.org.ph> and <rex@drilon.com>). 

 
 
“Addressing High Inflation  
in the Philippines”. . . 
(from page 1) 
 

a cyclical slowdown in economic growth to avoid 

recession (or what economists refer to as ‘soft 
landing’) is hard to pull off. Thus, fiscal policy 
tools are recommended to ease the task of 
monetary policy (i.e., increasing interest rates) in 
reducing inflation. This is owing to the fact that 
high inflation tends to worsen inequality and 

poverty because it hits income and savings 
harder for the poor and middle-income earners.  
 
BACKGROUND 
 
According to the Philippine Statistics Authority 
(PSA), our Gross Domestic Product (GDP) posted 

a growth of 7.6 percent in the third quarter of 
2022. In spite of the 14-year high inflation of 7.7 

percent in October 2022, GDP continues to 
expand mainly because of household 
consumption which contributes more than 70 
percent of economic growth on the demand side 

while services sector contributes about 67 
percent on the supply side.  
 
Higher annual growth rate in the index for food 
and non-alcoholic beverages at 9.4 percent 
contributed to the October inflation. Other 
commodity groups also contributed to the overall 

inflation like housing, water, electricity, gas and 
other fuels with 7.4 percent increase. 
 
Following the US Federal Reserve’s (Fed) 
aggressive stance against high inflation, the BSP 

further increased interest rate to 5 percent 
effective November 18, 2022. Thereafter, 

inflation targets have been adjusted to 5.8 
percent in 2022 and 4.3 percent in 2023. Ahead 
of the next expected policy rate increase in 
December to 5.5 percent, BSP Governor Felipe 
Medalla via forward guidance said BSP would 
prefer to match any rate increase by the Fed to 

maintain 100 basis points interest rate 
differential. 
 
Since BSP expects November annual inflation to 
still be between 7.4 to 8.2 percent, both fiscal and  
 

monetary policies may be needed to temper the 
increasing prices of food, electricity and 
agricultural products. In many emerging markets 

and developing countries (EMDC), fiscal restraint 

can lower inflation while reducing debt. 
 
Supply shocks, like high fuel prices, natural 
disasters, the Russia-Ukraine conflict and the 
continuing impact of COVID-19, among others, 
disrupt supply chain and production, resulting in 
lower productivity and higher costs. Initial data 

shows that these supply shocks may be causing 
the ‘cost-push’ inflation and that contractionary 
monetary policy may not be enough to temper it. 
 
In view of this, the following fiscal policy tools are 
recommended to the Philippine government 

through the Department of Finance with the aim 

of easing the hardship brought by high inflation, 
especially to the poor and middle-income 
earners: (1) increasing excise taxes on non-
essential goods, (2) imposing corporate income 
tax to non-resident foreign tech giants, (3) 
improving tax collections through digitalization, 

(4) cutting government spending, and (5) other 
government interventions. 
 
Increasing taxes 
 
While increasing taxes may be politically 
challenging, Congress can enact a law to increase 

taxes on non-essential goods, like luxury cars, 
alcoholic drinks, cigarettes including vapes which 

are not considered basic commodities. Revisiting 
the Tax Reform for Acceleration and Inclusion 
(TRAIN) Law to further increase excise tax on 
luxury cars from 60 to 200 percent will generate 

more revenues from the top 10 percent of 
households in terms of income as this is a highly 
progressive tax. There may be an initial slowdown 
in the sales of cars, alcohol and cigarettes but it 
will quickly recover as it did in the past. 
 
Imposing corporate income tax 

 
Instead of imposing 12 percent value added tax 
(VAT) on digital services which will only generate 
an estimate of P19 billion in revenues, imposing 
income tax or digital service tax to non-resident 

foreign tech giants and digital transactions, 
including cryptocurrency, may yield higher 

revenues without burdening the middle-income 
earners. How it will be collected may still be a 
question but it’s worth pursuing rather than 
simply imposing 12% VAT which will burden local 
consumers. 
 

Improving tax collections 
 
Revenue collections from audit and investigation 
contribute less than 2 percent to the total tax 
collections. 
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The government must instead prioritize the full 
digitalization of the Bureau of Internal Revenue 
(BIR) so that they can catch up with the fast-

paced development in the e-commerce and digital 

economy. This requires more budget for the BIR 
so that it can hire software engineers, developers 
and data analysts, and invest in IT infrastructure 
to rebuild its system. 
 
Implementing a general tax amnesty and lifting 
the Bank Secrecy Law will also generate more 

revenues without relying on regular audit and 
investigation. This will allow the BIR to run after 
big-time tax evaders since they would no longer 
be able to hide behind the Bank Secrecy Law. 
 
However, both legislations will require more 

political will from the President to make it a 

priority bill of his Administration. 
 
A risk-based audit will also generate more tax 
collections than the random audit. Using data 
analytics and industry benchmarking, the BIR can 
allocate their resources in auditing high-risk 

industries and taxpayers, especially large 
corporations which contribute more than 60% of 
the total tax collections. 
 
Cut government spending 
 
While checks and balances are in place, the 

government must cut spending, address 
loopholes in budget allocation, and deal with 

procurement issues that led to an average of P1 
Trillion (T) unused and misused/abused annual 
budget from 2010-2020. Transparency and 
accountability must be upheld, especially given 

the proposed P5.268T budget for 2023 and the 
increasing debt at P13.5T as of November 2022.  
 
Targeted subsidy and financial support to farmers 
and fisher folks must also be prioritized to 
increase domestic productivity which will reduce 
prices and importation of agricultural products. 

 
Other government interventions  
 
While subsidies are helpful, it is high time for the 
government to revisit the Oil Deregulation Law in 

order for it to have the power to intervene when 
there is a prolonged increase of oil prices. Also, 

reviving Private-Public Partnership (PPP) in lieu of 
foreign loans for infrastructure projects may also 
spread risk and reduce government debts. 
 
 

RECOMMENDATIONS 
 
Addressing high inflation requires a whole-of-

government approach. It requires fiscal 

consolidation through budget rationalization and 
more tax revenues. While the BSP uses monetary 
policy to temper inflation with the least possible 
job loss, the government must exercise fiscal 
restraint to lower inflationary pressures. 
 
First, government deficits and debts must be 

lowered. Rationalizing the government budget 
will not only cut unnecessary spending but also 
reduce the budget deficit. PPP may also be helpful 
in funding infrastructure projects to avoid 
incurring more foreign debts.  
 

Moreover, revenue efforts must be increased 

through tax policy and administration reforms. 
Increasing the excise tax on non-essential goods 
will serve as both a revenue and health measure, 
and imposing corporate income tax or digital 
service tax on non-resident foreign tech giants 
will generate more collections with the aid of 

technology.  
 
Tightening fiscal consolidation is hereby 
recommended to address high inflation in the 
Philippines and ease the hardships of the poor 
and the most vulnerable. 
  

(This article reflects the personal opinion of the 
author and does not reflect the official stand of 

the Management Association of the Philippines or 
MAP.  The author is a MPA/Mason Fellow at the 
Harvard Kennedy School. He is a member of the 
MAP Tax Committee and the MAP Ease of Doing 

Business Committee, Co-chair of Paying Taxes on 
Ease of Doing Business Task Force, and Chief Tax 
Advisor of the Asian Consulting Group. Feedback 
at <map@map.org.ph> and <mon@acg.ph>.) 
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1. “More critical than Maharlika” 
      from MAP Governor CIELITO “Ciel” F.   

      HABITO’s “No Free Lunch” Column in the  
      PHILIPPINE DAILY INQUIRER on  

       December 20, 2022 
 
Former 
A colleague recently posted in our chat group: 
“The reproductive health (RH) bill took 10 years 
to pass. The bill for a National Land Use Act 
(NLUA) has seen many presidents come and go 
and still lies sleeping in Congress. Maharlika is 
like a genie; after only three rubs of the 
congressional bellies, it’s out.” The speed at 
which the House of Representatives approved 
the measure establishing the Maharlika 
Investment Fund, defying wide cross-sectoral 
opposition and sober analyses that consistently 
argue it to be both unnecessary and dangerous, 
is truly remarkable. It reflects the arrogance of a 
body that refuses to live up to its formal name—
so soon after the people they claim to represent 
put them in power. 
 
Like my colleague, I am unhappy with how 
several congresses sat on critical pieces of 
legislation—the RH and NLUA bills being only two 
of many we’ve seen. The NLUA has been 
languishing for nearly three decades now. It was 
during my watch at the National Economic and 
Development Authority (Neda) that heads the 
National Land Use Committee (NLUC), when we 
first proposed the NLUA bill in 1994, at the ninth 
Congress. I recall how my undersecretary for 
regional development Aniceto “Chito” 
Sobrepeña, then Neda’s NLUC point person, 
mustered the political diplomacy skills he had 
honed as President Cory Aquino’s Cabinet 
secretary, to push for the bill in Congress. 
 
We’ve had 10 congresses since, but the closest 
NLUA ever got, after passage by the House, was 
a second reading in the Senate, in the 15th 
Congress in 2013. In the 16th and 17th 
Congresses, the bill also passed the House, but 
again stalled in the Senate despite successive 
strong pushes by Presidents Ramos, Arroyo, 
Aquino, and Duterte. Proponents see Sen. 
Cynthia Villar as the measure’s nemesis, having 
used her chairmanship of the committee on 
environment, natural resources, and climate 
change to keep the bill from reaching the plenary 
in both the 17th and 18th Congresses. That she 
continues to chair that same committee in the 
current 19th Congress dampens the hope of 
NLUA proponents. While she argues that the 
measure undermines the autonomy granted by 
law to local governments, they accuse her of 
conflict of interest given how the NLUA could 
restrict her family’s real estate business, which 
has made her husband the country’s richest 
man. 
 
 

Why is the NLUA critical for the country? The Food 
and Agriculture Organization of the United 

Nations notes that even as the Philippine 
Constitution mandates state regulation of 
property acquisition, ownership, use, and 
disposition with the aim of enhancing rights and 
reducing inequalities, “the distribution of land in 
the country remains highly skewed, and its use 
highly politicized.” The NLUA, it asserts, would 

“institutionalize a holistic, rational and 
comprehensive land use and physical planning 
mechanism, which will appropriately identify land 
use and allocation patterns in all parts of the 

country … (it) would also provide for an 
environment that would better foster food 

security.” Moreover, “the NLUA would also 
harmonize present policies on land use, to 
address competing uses of land and balance the 
country’s needs for food, settlements, 
biodiversity, climate resilience, and industry.” 
 
On the argument that the NLUA violates the 

autonomy that the 1991 Local Government Code 
grants local government units (LGUs), 
proponents point out that LGU powers need not 
be impaired, but must be guided and limited by 
national policy and standards. Cynics claim that 
the real estate industry has persistently lobbied 
against the NLUA as they would rather see LGUs 

having complete discretion on land use because 
“mas madali silang kausap (they are easier to talk 
to).” And with two members of the family of the 
country’s richest real estate magnate firmly 
ensconced in the Philippine Senate, it’s hard to be 
optimistic about the NLUA finally becoming law. 

 
Call it wishful thinking, but there are those who 
hope that the Villars would prove their accusers 
wrong by yielding to the long-standing and 
convincing arguments, from both domestic and 
foreign analysts, that enacting the NLUA is critical 
to the Filipinos’ future. 

 
 

cielito.habito@gmail.com 
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2. “Time to (Po) go” 
      from MAP Governor PETER WALLACE’s         
      “Like it is” Column in the  

      PHILIPPINE DAILY INQUIRER on  

       December 19, 2022 
 
There’s yet no decision, so I’m going to weigh in. 
 
I’m one of those odd people that doesn’t put 
money first. Pursuing a satisfying career of 
accomplishment in an honest, moral life and 
living it ethically trumps (I wish I didn’t have to 
use that word) money first. On that basis, the 
delightful comic book “Pogo” of my childhood was 
a delight, a wonderful part of growing up. On that 
basis, the Philippine offshore gaming operators 
(Pogos) on the boulevard must go. They have no 
role to play in Christian life. 
 
As far as I’m concerned that applies not only to 
Pogo but to all forms of gambling. It damages far, 
far more people than it ever benefits. Where on 
earth do the gamblers think the huge sums 
needed to build the opulent casinos come from—
them as they lose and lose, and lose. But freedom 
to live your life the way you choose, as long as it 
doesn’t negatively impact others is absolute as 
far as I’m concerned. So if people want to throw 
their money away, let them. It’s their money. 
 
This applies to Pogos, too. They should be allowed 
if they don’t negatively affect others. The thing is, 
they do. Their negative impact on the rest of 
society is worse than whatever benefit they 
provide. There is, in fact, little benefit, but 
considerable harm. 
 
Those who defend the continued existence of 
Pogos in the country justify it by the revenues and 
jobs we stand to lose if they shut down. But the 
Department of Finance, which well knows the 
financial condition of the country, has made clear 
to Congress its stance against the continuation of 
Pogos. It estimates that the total economic 
contribution of the industry is P64.6 billion. Much 
of that is indirect that will continue but serve 
other activities. 
 
Pogos’ contribution to the government from that 
is miniscule. It was a mere P7.2 billion in 2020 
when things were normal. That’s only 0.25 
percent of government revenues. In 2021, this 
halved to P3.9 billion. The better result in 2020 
was due to the government’s more effective 
campaign against tax-dodging Pogos and their 
service providers in 2019, as well as some 
licensees finally paying the 5-percent franchise 
tax—a prerequisite for them to resume partial 
operations during the enhanced community 
quarantine. Helping there was Republic Act No. 
11494 or Bayanihan 2 which changed the base of 
the tax rate to gross bets amid alleged cheating 
when computing their net winnings previously. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

As to potential job losses, Filipinos make up a 
measly share of Pogo-related employment. The 
industry employs almost entirely Chinese 

nationals because of the language needed as 

most of the gambling emanates from China. Many 
of these Chinese are here illegally, or worse, 
victims of human trafficking. It has led to the 
entry of thousands and thousands of Chinese 
workers, many of them through reported bribery 
amongst some immigration officials, which raises 
a diplomatic problem. Gambling is illegal in China, 

it’s why the casinos have moved here. What do 
you think Xi Jinping thinks about a country that 
allows its citizens to undertake illegal activity in 
another country? 
 
The Anti-Money Laundering Council discovered a 

high level of money laundering and other 

fraudulent activities and a high number of 
unregulated or unsupervised service providers, 
and a low level of beneficial ownership 
identification (the government doesn’t know the 
real owners of accounts). 
 

Admittedly, the real estate market would suffer 
as office and residential demand fades away, but 
then lower rentals would lead to wider demand 
from other industries such as BPOs, which 
continue to grow. Some retail consumption may 
be lost as well, but these economic sectors are 
resilient. They’ll survive. 

 
As Finance Secretary Benjamin Diokno says, we 

are at “reputational risk.” Already we have been 
included in the International Financial Action Task 
Force list of countries under increased monitoring 
due to the suspicion that Pogos have been a route 

for money laundering. We are now on their “gray 
list.” If that’s raised to the “red list,” it would 
damage foreign remittances and investment 
flows immensely. 
 
Their negative impact on society is worse than 
whatever benefit they provide. Pogos’ final exit 

wouldn’t affect us much. Whilst tax collections are 
halved and there’s a return of economic activity 
in other more promising sectors, now is a good 
time to shut Pogos down. Time to (Po) go. 
 

Email: wallace_likeitis@wbf.ph 
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      November 22, 2022                                                                  

      MAP Annual General Membership Meeting and  

      “MAP Management Man of the Year 2022” 

      Awarding Ceremony       

 

 
      

      November 11, 2022                                                                 October 13, 2022                                                                  

      3rd MAP NextGen Conference 2022                                        MAP GMM       

                                                          
 

      September 13, 2022                                                                 September 8, e2022                                                                                                                  

      MAP International CEO Hybrid Conference                              MAP – PMAP Joint GMM                                                                

  

     August 19, 2022                                                                      July 14, 2022                                               

  MAP GMM                                                                                MAP GMM                                                          
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      July 1, 2022                                                                             June 23, 2022 

      MAP Webinar                                                                            MAP GMM         

       
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

   May 19, 2022                                                                           May 2, 2022                                                     

   MAP GMM                                                                                 MAP Webinar                                                                                

  
 
 

   April 29, 2022                                                                           April 29, 2022 

   MAP Webinar                                                                            MAP Webinar 

  

 
 

    April 27, 2022                                                                       April 22, 2022 

       MAP Lecture                                                                          MAP Webinar 
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   March 24, 2022                                                                      March 9, 2022 

   MAP General Membership Meeting                                        MAP Lecture 

 

 

   
 

 

 

 

 

   February 10, 2022                                           January 13, 2022                           
   MAP Economic Briefing and                             MAP Inaugural Meeting and  
   General Membership Meeting                          Induction of MAP 2022 Board of Governors 
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DECEMBER 1 

1. Mr. WINSTON “Winnie” A. CHAN 

2. Mr. VENJOSEF “Ven” M. SIO 

President, Sanitary Care Products Asia, Inc. (SCPA) 

 

DECEMBER 2 

3. Atty. ENGELBERT “Jojo” C. CARONAN JR. 

President and CEO, Development Academy of the 

Philippines (DAP)  

4. Dr. CHITO B. SALAZAR 

President and COO, PHINMA Corporation 

 

DECEMBER 3 

5. Mr. NOEL E. BONGAT 

President & CEO, Corinthians Integrated Security, Inc. 

6. Mr. RONALD FRANCIS “Ron” M. DOMPOR 

CEO, Fast Distribution Corporation 

7. Ms. EMMA IMPERIAL 

President and CEO, Imperial Homes Corporation  

 

DECEMBER 4 

8. Ms. PAMELA “Pam” M. DONATO 

Vice President for HR-PHANZ, Sitel Philippines 

Corporation  

9. Mr. BENJAMIN “Ben”  V. RAMOS 

President and CEO, Eternal Gardens Memorial Park 

Corporation  

 

DECEMBER 5 

10. Ms. MARIA CORAZON “Corrie” D. PURISIMA 

Treasurer and Head of Global Markets, HSBC 

Philippines  

 

DECEMBER 6 

11. Mr. EDMUNDO “Ed” S. ISIDRO 

President, EI Operations Management Group, Inc.  

12. Mr. ROBERT “Bob” C. MEILY LEHMANN 

President and CEO, Amalgamated Investment 

Bancorporation  

13. Ms. MARIA AZALEA “Lea” S. PACIS 

Marketing Communications Director, Sanitary Care 

Products Asia, Inc. (SCPA) 

14. Mr. DANIEL RODRIGO “Danny” D. REYES 

VP for Business Development, University of Asia and 

the Pacific (UA&P)  

15. Mr. ANTHONY JOSE “Anthony” M. TAMAYO 

President, University of Perpetual Help System 

DALTA  

 

DECEMBER 7 

16. Mr. ERIC NG MENDOZA 

President and CEO, Mastercraft Philippines, Inc.  

 

DECEMBER 8 

17. Mr. JOEY A. BERMUDEZ 

Chair, Maybridge Finance and Leasing, Inc. 

18. Mr. LAWRENCE “Law” Y. FERRER 

President and CEO, CIS Bayad Center, Inc.  

19. Atty. FELIPE “Henry” L. GOZON 

Chair and CEO, GMA Network, Inc.  

 

 

DECEMBER 9 

20. Mr. TOMAS “Tim” S. CHUIDIAN 

SVP and Head of BPI Private Banking, Bank of the 

Philippine Islands (BPI)  

21. Mr. RICHARD ANTONIO “Richard” MORAN TAMAYO 

President, University of Perpetual Help System 

DALTA Medical Center  

22. Atty. EDGAR S. TORDESILLAS 

Corporate Counsel, Sun Life of Canada (Philippines), 

Inc.  

 

DECEMBER 10 

23. Ms. NINA DATU AGUAS 

Executive Chair of the Board of Trustees, InLife  

24. Ms. LEAH Z. CARINGAL 

President and CEO, Green Bulb Public Relations, Inc.  

25. Ms. MHARICAR “Cai” CASTILLO REYES 

President and CEO, Asticom Technology Inc.  

 

DECEMBER 11 

26. Cong. JANETTE LORETO GARIN 

Representative, 1st District of Iloilo, House of 

Representatives  

27. Ms. MARIA CRISTINA “Cristy” C. GOTIANUN 

President and COO, Semirara Mining and Power 

Corporation  

28. Mr. RICHARD S. LIM 

President, Sun Life Grepa Financial, Inc.  

29. Mr. ALEXANDER “Alex” S. NARCISO 

President, Sun Life of Canada (Philippines), Inc.  

 

DECEMBER 12 

30. Mr. HERBERT “Herby” M. CONSUNJI 

Chief Finance Officer, DMCI Holdings, Inc.  

31. Dr. ARTURO “Art” S. DE LA PEÑA 

President and CEO, St. Luke's Medical Center  

32. Mr. FERDINAND “Perry” A. FERRER 

Chair and CEO, Gruppo EMS, Inc.  

33. Dr. ANDREAS “Andi” KLIPPE 

President and CEO, FLOOD CONTROL Asia RS 

Corporation  

34. Mr. AVIN CO ONG 

CEO, Fredley Group of Companies  

35. Cong. ROMERO “Miro” F.S. QUIMBO 

Representative - 2nd District of Marikina City, House 

of Representatives  

36. Ms. CHRISTINA “Tina” CHUA TAN 

President, Suy Sing Commercial Corporation  

37. PM CESAR E.A. VIRATA 

Corporate Vice Chair, Rizal Commercial Banking 

Corporation (RCBC)  

 

DECEMBER 13 

38. Mr. SHIJU VARGHESE 

President and Country Head, Tata Consultancy 

Services (Philippines) Inc.  

39. Sen. MANUEL “Manny” B. VILLAR JR. 

Chair, Vista Land and Lifescapes, Inc.  

40. Mr. ROBERT L. YUPANGCO 

President, Zoomanity Group  

 

 

30 
Happy Birthday to the following MAP Members who are  

celebrating their birthdays within December 1 to 31, 2022  
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DECEMBER 14 

41. Mr. FRANCISCO “Frank” R. BILLANO 

CEO, President and General Manager, Interphil 

Laboratories, Inc.  

42. Ms. VICTORIA “Viksi” Z. EGAN 

43. Dr. JESUS “Jess” P. ESTANISLAO 

Chair Emeritus, Institute of Corporate Directors (ICD)  

44. Mr. EUSEBIO “Bimbo” M. GARCIA JR. 

Director, Chemphil Group of Companies  

45. Mr. ZDENEK “Z” JANKOVSKY 

Executive Director and Corporate Treasurer, HC 

Consumer Finance Philippines, Inc. – Home Credit  

46. Dr. PHILIP “Popoy” E. JUICO 

Chair, Kennedy Energy and Development Corporation  

 

DECEMBER 15 

47. Mr. RAMON “Mon” F. GARCIA 

Managing Partner, Ramon F. Garcia and Company, 

CPAs  

48. Mr. GIL B. GENIO 

Chief Technology and Information Officer, Globe 

Telecom, Inc.  

49. Mr. WILSON P. NG 

President and CEO, Ng Khai Development 

Corporation  

50. Mr. ELFREN ANTONIO “Boyie” S. SARTE 

President and CEO, Robinsons Bank Corporation  

 

DECEMBER 16 

51. Mr. VINCE LAWRENCE “Vince” L. ABEJO 

Chief Sales and Marketing Officer, Filinvest Land, Inc. 

52. Mr. JAMES PATRICK “James” A. ALBA 

CEO, Vendo Corporation  

53. Mr. MICHAEL “Mike” L. ESCALER 

CEO, All Asian Countertrade, Inc.  

54. Mr. PHILLIP “Phil” L. ONG 

Chair, Santeh Feeds Corporation  

55. Ms. SUSAN GRACE “Susan” C. RIVERA 

Managing Consultant, Talent, Leadership and Change 

(TLC)  

 

DECEMBER 17 

56. Mr. CHRISTIAN DANIEL “Chris” S. FERRERAS 

COO, Manila Uni Capital Group of Companies  

57. Mr. RAUL L. IGNACIO 

President and General Manager, MPTC / MPT Mobility  

58. Atty. MARIA PURISIMA “Mimi” Q. SISON 

Board Director, Caleb Motor Corporation  

 

DECEMBER 18 

59. Mr. CESAR A. BUENAVENTURA 

Senior Partner, Buenaventura, Echauz and Partners  

60. Ms. MA. RHODORA “Ayhee” L. CAMPOS 

          Country Head, Infosys BPO Limited 

 

DECEMBER 19 

61. Ms. GINA MARIE “Gina” G. ANGANGCO 

Deputy CEO, Armscor Global Defense, Inc.  

62. Dr. ELFREN S. CRUZ 

Chair, Lockton Philippines Insurance and Reinsurance 

Brokers, Inc.  

63. Atty. JOHN PETER FERDINAND “Ferdi” S. ECHIVERRI 

Head of Stakeholder Relations, Global 

Communications, PMFTC, Inc.  

 

DECEMBER 20 

64. Engr. LIBERITO “Levy” V. ESPIRITU 

President, Datem, Inc.  

 

65. Mr. GENARO VISARRA “Genju” LAPEZ 

Independent Director, China Banking Corporation 

(Chinabank) 

66. Ms. ROWENA LIZA “Rowena” D. SAQUIN 

VP and General Manager, Fisher Rosemount Systems 

Inc. - Philippine Branch (FRSI-PB)  

 

DECEMBER 21 

67. Ms. OLIVIA “Olive” LIMPE AW 

President and CEO, Destileria Limtuaco and 

Company, Inc.  

68. Mr. LEONARDO “Jun” D. CUARESMA JR. 

Managing Partner and COO, P&A Grant Thornton  

69. Ms. TOMASA “Tammy” H. LIPANA 

Independent Director, SM Investments Corporation  

70. Mr. GERARDO “Gerry” A. PLANA 

President and CEO, Investors in People Philippines  

71. Mr. GLICERIO “Glicer” V. SICAT 

Consultant, Inter Pacific Capital Corp.  

72. Amb. JESUS “Chuching” P. TAMBUNTING 

Chair and President, Capital Shares Investment 

Corporation  

 

DECEMBER 22 

73. Atty. JOSE “Joey” D. LINA JR. 

President, Manila Hotel  

74. Ms. SYLVIA STOLK 

VP - Operations, Maxicare  

 

DECEMBER 23 

75. Mr. VICTORIO “Vic” M. AMANTE 

76. Ms. MARIA VICTORIA “Marivic” E. AÑONUEVO 

Chair and President, Mejora Ferro Corporation  

77. Mr. EMMANUEL “Noel” A. RAPADAS 

SVP and CFO, Torre Lorenzo Development 

Corporation  

78. Mr. CESAR N. SARINO 

 

DECEMBER 24 

79. Prof. EMMANUEL “Noel” A. LEYCO 

President, Pamantasan ng Lungsod ng Maynila (PLM)  

 

DECEMBER 25 

80. Mr. HANS VOLTAIRE “Hans” R. BAYABORDA 

President and CEO, Asia Select, Inc.  

81. Mr. EMMANUEL “Sonny” V. HALILI 

CEO and Founder, Intellection Corp. Philippines / 

Singapore  

82. Mr. ERNESTO “Esto” E. LICHAUCO 

VP, Resins Incorporated  

 

DECEMBER 26 

83. Amb. CARLOS CHAN 

Chair, Liwayway Group  

84. Mr. ANTOLIN “Len” M. ORETA JR. 

Director, Intra Strata Assurance Corporation  

85. Mr. JOLLY L. TING 

Chair, Jolliville Holdings Corporation  

 

DECEMBER 27 

86. Mr. JUSTINO JUAN “Justin” R. OCAMPO 

Managing Director and Head - Macquarie Capital 

Philippines, Macquarie Group of Companies (Manila 

Office)  

 

DECEMBER 28 

87. Ms. ELIZABETH “Liz” S.P. LIETZ 

CEO, Rudolf Lietz, Inc.  
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DECEMBER 29 

88. Mr. RAUL “Ronnie” T. CONCEPCION 

Chair and CEO, Concepcion Industries, Inc.  

89. Mr. JOSE “Joe” S. CONCEPCION JR. 

Chair, RFM Corporation  

90. Ms. ROSSANA “Rossan” LLENADO 

President, AHEAD Education Group  

91. Mr. RICARDO “Ric” S. PASCUA 

Chair, Caelum Developers Inc.  

92. Mr. REMY “Rem” T. TIGULO 

Chair, Chemitron Enterprises, Inc.  

93. Ms. IMELDA “Ida” C. TIONGSON 

President and CEO, OPAL Portfolio Investments (SPV-

AMC) Inc.  

 

DECEMBER 30 

94. Mr. EXEQUIEL “Jun” P. VILLACORTA JR. 

Chair and President, Financial Advisers and Strategic 

Thinkers, Inc.  
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Condolence to the bereaved family of the following: 
 

Atty.  LEO G. DOMINGUEZ 

President of OLLI Consulting Group, Inc. 

who passed away on November 26, 2022 at the age of 67. 

Condolence to the bereaved family of the following: 
 

MAP Life Member VICTOR “Vic” L. MAGDARAOG 

Senior Business Adviser of Advisory & Insights (A&I), 

who passed away on December 18, 2022 at the age of 71. 



 
 

 
 
Please subscribe to “MAP Talks” on YOUTUBE: 
 
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCeNlKpZ2CZmVkrjh9GNfSoA 
 
Please follow MAP on FACEBOOK: 
 
https://web.facebook.com/map.org.ph 
 
Please connect with MAP thru LINKEDIN: 
 
https://www.linkedin.com/in/mapphilippines/ 
 
Please visit the new MAP Website by clicking the following: 
 
<map.org.ph> 
 
Please join the “MAP Bulletin Board” Viber community by clicking the following: 

 
https://invite.viber.com/?g2=AQB96LUTksl4X03UidOSgWDEPCjwdBfZLGFrjkuDpC1j%2FCpAHFFj0k
gzkmWL2hvc 
 
 
 

https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCeNlKpZ2CZmVkrjh9GNfSoA
https://web.facebook.com/map.org.ph
https://www.linkedin.com/in/mapphilippines/
http://map.net.ph/
https://invite.viber.com/?g2=AQB96LUTksl4X03UidOSgWDEPCjwdBfZLGFrjkuDpC1j%2FCpAHFFj0kgzkmWL2hvc
https://invite.viber.com/?g2=AQB96LUTksl4X03UidOSgWDEPCjwdBfZLGFrjkuDpC1j%2FCpAHFFj0kgzkmWL2hvc

